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Property Detail
Price 5,160,000 THB
Location Phuket Town Thailand
Bedrooms 2
Bathrooms 2
Land Size area
Building Size 56 sqm
Type condos



Description

Buy Condo in Phuket

Welcome to the epitome of privacy and luxury living at this Downtown Phuket foreign freehold
condominium. Prepare to be delighted by the remarkable array of first-class facilities and the
coveted sense of exclusivity it offers.

Situated at the heart of vibrant Phuket City, this condominium's superb location ensures effortless
commuting to work, exquisite dining experiences, unrivaled shopping venues, and limitless
entertainment options both within the city and beyond.

Spread across 3.3 Rai of land, this downtown condominium comprises two impressive 7-story
buildings, totaling 311 suites. Immerse yourself in a world of comfort and convenience as you
explore the endless possibilities this exceptional development has to offer.

Indulge in a wealth of top-notch amenities, including a refreshing swimming pool and a separate
kids pool for the little ones to enjoy. Stay active and energized in the well-equipped exercise room,
while the multi-purpose areas cater to your various needs and interests. Take a moment to unwind
in the lush gardens and outdoor recreation areas, creating your own oasis of tranquility amidst the
bustling city.

Step into the inviting lobby, where a warm and welcoming ambiance greets you. Stay connected
with WiFi access available in the lobby and pool areas, ensuring you can effortlessly keep up with
the demands of the modern world. Rest easy knowing that 24-hour security, CCTV surveillance,
and ample parking spaces are provided for your safety and convenience.

It's worth noting that this property will be a registered condominium, allowing for the sale of 49% of
the units as "condominium foreign freehold." This special type of freehold title grants foreigners the
ability to directly and legally own property in Thailand, much like they would in their own country.
The Condominium Act governs many aspects of condominium ownership, ensuring transparency
for property developers and offering a level of consumer protection for condominium buyers.

Embrace the opportunity to own a piece of this Downtown Phuket foreign freehold condominium.
Discover a lifestyle that harmoniously combines privacy, luxury, and convenience. Contact us today
to embark on a journey of sophisticated urban living in the heart of Phuket City.
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